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Minute No. 233 
Report - Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public Works – 
February 9, 2010 
 
Item No. 2  Award of Contract for Collection of Recyclables 
   eFile GL-9 
 
COUNCIL DECISION: 
 
That the Winnipeg Public Service be directed to seek an extension of approximately 6 months to 
the current contract regarding recycling to allow time for a comprehensive recycling strategy to 
be developed. 
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Report - Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public Works – 
February 9, 2010 
 
DECISION MAKING HISTORY: 
 
Moved by Councillor Clement, 
   That the recommendation of the Standing Policy Committee on 
Infrastructure Renewal and Public Works be adopted. 
 
   The motion for adoption of the item was put. 
 
   Councillor Gerbasi called for the yeas and nays, which were as follows: 
 
   Yea:  Councillors Fielding, Pagtakhan, Steeves and Swandel. 4 
 
   Nay:  His Worship Mayor Katz, Councillors Browaty, Clement, Gerbasi, 
Nordman, Orlikow, Smith, Thomas, Wyatt and Lazarenko. 10 
 
and the motion for adoption of the item was declared lost. 
 
 
Moved by Councillor Clement, 
   That the rule be suspended to consider an additional motion on this 
subject. 

 Carried 
 
Moved by Councillor Clement, 
Seconded by Councillor Swandel, 
   That the Winnipeg Public Service be directed to seek an extension of 
approximately 6 months to the current contract regarding recycling to allow time for a 
comprehensive recycling strategy to be developed. 
          Carried 
 
 
EXECUTIVE POLICY COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION: 
 
On February 17, 2010, the Executive Policy Committee concurred in the recommendation of the 
Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public Works and submitted the 
matter to Council. 
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Report - Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public Works – 
February 9, 2010 
 
 
DECISION MAKING HISTORY (continued): 
 
STANDING COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION: 
 
On February 9, 2010, the Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public 
Works concurred in the recommendation of the Winnipeg Public Service and submitted the 
matter to Council. 
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ADMINISTRATIVE REPORT 
 
ISSUE: AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR COLLECTION OF RECYCLABLES 

 BID OPPORTUNITY NO. 744-2009 
 
Critical Path: Standing Policy Committee on Infrastructure Renewal and Public 

Works, EPC, Council 
 
AUTHORIZATION 

 

RECOMMENDATIONS 
 
1. Subject to the Workplace Safety and Health requirements in accordance with B11.4 of the 

Bid Opportunity being satisfied, that a multi-year contract for Bid Opportunity No. 744-2009 
be awarded to National Waste Services Inc. for Alternative B2- Automated Collection with 
City Provided Carts, the lowest responsive bidder for Alternative B2 meeting the 
specifications in the amount of $4,674,240.00/year, GST and MRST extra as applicable for 
the period of September 16, 2010 to March 2, 2018.  The total estimated cost over the term 
of the contract is $35,056,800.00, GST and MRST extra as applicable.  

 
2. That Council direct the Public Service to issue a Bid Opportunity for the lease or purchase, 

whichever is financially advantageous, of 185,000 carts to coincide with the above in-service 
date of September 16, 2010.  If leased, there are funds available in the proposed 2010-2012 
Current Estimates for these payments.   

 
IMPLICATIONS OF THE RECOMMENDATIONS 
 
Funds for this work are included every year in the Annual Current Budget from the Solid Waste 
Recycling Account Distribution No. 445 521025 201907 999. 
 
As the term of the contract exceeds five years and the contract creates an absolute commitment 
for funds not yet approved by Council, Council must approve the award of contract. 
 
The work of this contract consists of the annual collection of approximately 36,000 metric tonnes 
of Recyclables from Winnipeg single family residential premises and delivery to the City’s 
contracted Material Recovery Facility for the period of September 16, 2010 to March 2, 2018. 

Author Department Head CFO CAO 
D.E. Drohomerski, 

C.E.T. 
Manager of Solid 

Waste 

M. L. Geer, C.A. 
Acting Director, Water 
and Waste Department 

M. Ruta G. Laubenstein 
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The Bid Opportunity closed on January 6, 2010, with bids being received as follows: 
 
 

Table 1 

 National Waste 
Services Inc. 

BFI Canada 
Inc. 

Halton 
Recycling Ltd. 
dba Emterra 

Environmental 

Miller Waste 
Systems Inc. 

Alternative A 
Manual Collection with Blue 
Boxes 

$4,474,200.00 $4,313,560.00 $4,440,000.00 $5,154,542.00 

Alternative B1 
Weekly, Automated Collection 
with City supplied 240 litre 
Carts 
(Lanes serviced-single side) 

$4,570,920.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$5,803,920.00 

$4,342,120.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$5,575,120.00 

$4,893,600.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$6,126,600.00 

NO BID 

Alternative B2 
Weekly, Automated Collection 
with City supplied 240 litre 
Carts 
(Lanes serviced-both sides) 

$4,674,240.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$5,907,240.00 

$4,825,240.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$6,058,240.00 

$4,893,600.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$6,126,600.00 

NO BID 

Alternative C1 
Bi-weekly, Automated 
Collection with City supplied 
240 litre or 360 Litre Carts 
(Lanes serviced- single side) 

$3,033,720.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$4,266,720.00 

$2,452,120.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$3,685,120.00 

$3,813,600.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$5,046,600.00 

NO BID 

Alternative C2 
Bi-weekly, Automated 
Collection with City supplied 
240 litre or 360 Litre Carts 
(Lanes serviced both sides) 

$3,203,280.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$4,436,280.00 

$2,685,400.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$3,918,400.00 

$3,813,600.00 
$1,233,000.00 
$5,046,600.00 

NO BID 

 
In accordance with Clause D16 Unit Price Adjustment of the Bid Opportunity document, the unit 
prices will be adjusted on the first day of the contract, September 16, 2010, and on subsequent 
anniversary dates based on Statistics Canada Consumer Price Indices for All-items (for the City 
of Winnipeg), Gasoline (private transportation for the Province of Manitoba) and Average Hourly 
Earnings (employees paid by the hour in truck transportation for the Province of Manitoba).  
   
The pre-bid estimate is $5,940,000.00 for manual blue box collection.  Based on past estimates, 
it was expected that cart collection would be the same to slightly more expensive than manual 
blue box collection for the same collection frequency.  The current cost for blue box collection is 
$4,820,000 per year. 
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This Bid Opportunity sought prices from bidders for manual-style collection using blue boxes, 
weekly automated-style collection using 240 litre carts, and biweekly automated-style collection 
using 240 litre or 360 litre carts.  In accordance with Clause B15 Evaluation of Bids, Bidders 
were informed that the City has the right to choose the alternate which is in its best interests and 
will utilize the results of public surveys conducted in November 2009 as part of the decision 
making process. 
 
To capture the true cost of cart collection, the cost of the carts must be factored into the total bid 
price.  In Alternatives B1, B2, C1, and C2, the Total Bid Price includes an allowance of 
$1,233,000.00 per year for the City to furnish the 185,00 carts in this contract.  The unit cost for 
the supply and delivery of the carts to each residence was estimated by staff at $50 per unit.  
The funds required to finance or lease the carts is included in the operating budget.  Purchase 
of the carts would require Capital Budget approval of $9,250,000. 
 
The results of the on-line market research studies, surveys and the eight public open-houses 
conducted in November 2009 revealed that: 
 
• 74% of residents are recycling more than they did five years ago; a trend that should 

continue.  

• 71% of recycling households currently use two or more blue boxes. 

• 73% of respondents who currently recycle anticipated they would like using the new cart. 

• 36% of the respondents stated they would likely recycle more if they had the new cart. 

• 32% of respondents felt the new carts would be more difficult to use. 

• 55% or respondents stated that the benefits of these new carts outweigh any drawbacks. 

• 70% of respondents indicated they would prefer the 240 litre cart over the 360 litre cart. 

 
Additionally, in the Omnibus survey, residents were asked: 
 
“If the cost of recycling cart collection was the same as the current Blue Box collection, which of 
the following three options do you think the City of Winnipeg should pursue with respect to its 
residential recycling program?” 
 

• 41% stated “Replace the Blue Boxes with larger Recycling Carts but continue with the once-
a-week pickup schedule”; 

• 28% responded “Keep the current Blue Boxes and the once-a week pickup schedule”; 

• 24% stated “Replace the Blue Boxes with larger Recycling Carts but change the pickup 
schedule to once every 2 weeks”. 

 
The Public Service recommends moving to cart collection because; 
 
• 65% of residents would like to replace blue boxes with recycling carts. 
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• It offers the resident a larger container at that will provide enough capacity to meet current 
and future demands in most households. 

• It will reduce litter, thereby helping to keep neighbourhoods cleaner.  

• Experience in other municipalities suggests there is an increase in the amount of material 
collected when container capacity is increased. 

 
The Public Service recommends weekly collection of recyclables because: 
 
• Participation in the City’s recycling program is voluntary.  While feedback about the different 

recycling options was collected using different methods, 41% of residents preferred the 240 
litre cart with collection occurring every week.  Residents, unhappy with the decision to move 
to less frequent collection, may chose not to recycle at all.  This would have a negative 
impact on the City’s waste diversion efforts as there would be a decline in the amount of 
material collected in the program and thus diverted from the landfill. 

• A decline in tonnes collected would result in increased garbage collection and disposal costs 
and thus increased Provincial Waste Reduction and Recycling Support (WRARS) landfill 
levies, decreased MMSM recoveries, and ultimately, a reduction in funding from the WRARS 
fund.  A decrease in the quantity of material recycled would contradict the City’s and MMSM 
goal of maximum diversion. 

• In 2006, Waste Diversion Ontario (WDO) commissioned a study to review current practices 
across a number of Ontario municipal recycling programs.  The July 2007 report, entitled 
Blue Box Program Enhancement and Best Practices Assessment Project1, states that 
programs that collect recyclables at least as frequently as garbage, exhibit 10% higher 
recovery rates. 

• Residents who currently use multiple boxes may find the capacity of even the larger cart, 
insufficient for biweekly collection.  Residents would be tempted to easily dispose of the 
excess recyclables in the garbage which would be collected on a weekly basis. 

• In bi-weekly collection, residents that don’t place the cart out on collection day and miss 
collection must wait an additional two weeks until their next scheduled collection day.  This 
would mean that they will hold onto their recyclables for four weeks, which would greatly limit 
their storage ability and thus tempt them to discard the recyclables.  

• Many residents would likely choose 360 litre carts (instead of the regular 240 litre size) to 
ensure they have enough storage volume for a two week period.  For example, if 50% of 
residents chose the larger cart, the additional capital cost to the program would be 
approximately $1,000,000 or $134,000 per year.  This amount has not been included in 
Table 1, above.  

 
The Public Service further recommends that service in the lane collection areas be provided to 
both sides of the lane, as: 
 

                                                 
1 Available at http://www.stewardshipontario.ca/bluebox/pdf/eefund/KPMG_final_report_vol1.pdf 
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• The additional cost of this option (over lane collection – single side) is $332,120.00 per year 
or $2,490,900.00 over the length of the contract.  This translates to approximately $1.80 per 
household per year. 

• Decreased participation due to perceived lack of service for those residents, who must cross 
the lane to their service location, may result in less tonnage recycled. 

The cost for the recommended Alternative B2, the Weekly, Automated Collection of Recyclables 
(with Lanes serviced on both sides), including the cost to supply the carts, is estimated to be 
$5,907,240.00 per year.  
 
For the above noted reasons the Department recommends award based on Alternative B2 – 
Automated Collection with City Provided Carts, as being in the best interests of the City. 
 
Solid Waste Services staff of this Department are satisfied that the low Bidder of Alternative B2 
has the necessary resources to perform all of the work in accordance with the requirements of 
the specifications.  The low Bidder has satisfactorily carried out previous collection works of a 
similar nature in the province of Ontario. 
 
The proposed Contractor does not have a valid COR certification number under the Certificate 
of Recognition (COR) Program administered by the Manitoba Construction Safety Association 
or by the Manitoba Heavy Construction Association’s Safety, Health and Environment Program.  
Prior to award, a Safety Consultant approved by the City of Winnipeg will review the proposed 
Contractor’s safety program to ensure that it meets the requirements of the Workplace, Safety 
and Health Act (Manitoba). 
 
The Manager of Materials has advised that each of the bid submissions was accompanied by 
satisfactory bid security.  The recommended bid is the lowest bid of all received for Alternative 
B2 which meets all requirements of the specifications, and is in the best interests of the City, as 
it matches the public’s program preference.  This offer is open for acceptance until May 6, 2010. 
 
HISTORY 
 
At its October 28th meeting, Council approved a tendering strategy for the new 2010 collection 
contract for the City’s residential recycling program.  The Public Service was directed to obtain 
costs for different collection alternatives along with a cost for the collection service of the current 
blue box program.  Also, the Public Service was to conduct public consultation on residential 
recycling including on-line market research surveys, public open houses at four locations across 
the city, and to post the results on the City’s website.  In conjunction with the OurWinnipeg Call 
to Action open houses, the Department held a total of eight open houses across the city in 
November.  The results of this public consultation are detailed in reports entitled Public Attitudes 
towards Recycling Program, and are included as appendices to this report. 
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FINANCIAL IMPACT 
 
The following financial impact statement for this project has been prepared in accordance with 
the recommendation adopted by Council on December 13, 2000. 
 
Financial Impact Statement Date: January 11, 2010

Project Name: First Year of Program 2010

2010 2011 2012 2013 2014
Capital
Capital Expenditures Required -$                 -$               -$               -$               -$                
Less:  Existing Budgeted Costs -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
Additional Capital Budget Required -$                 -$               -$               -$               -$                

Funding Sources:
Debt - Internal -$                 -$               -$               -$               -$                
Debt - External -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
Grants (Enter Description Here) -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
Reserves, Equity, Surplus -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
Other -  Enter Description Here -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
  Total Funding -$                 -$               -$               -$               -$                

Total Additional Capital Budget
Required -$                 

Total Additional Debt Required -$                 

Current Expenditures/Revenues
Direct Costs 1,363,320$      4,674,240$    4,674,240$    4,674,240$    4,674,240$     
Less:  Incremental Revenue/Recovery -                   -                 -                 -                 -                  
Net Cost/(Benefit) 1,363,320$      4,674,240$    4,674,240$    4,674,240$    4,674,240$     
Less:  Existing Budget Amounts 1,363,320        4,674,240      4,674,240      4,674,240      4,674,240       
Net Budget Adjustment Required -$                 -$               -$               -$               -$                

js
11-Jan-10 Acting Manager of Finance and Administration

Lucy Szkwarek, C.G.A.

AWARD OF CONTRACT FOR COLLECTION OF RECYCLABLES
BID OPPORTUNITY NO. 744-2009

Additional Comments:   Funds for this work are included every year in the Annual Current Budget for Recycling, 
Solid Waste, Account Distribution No. 445 521025 201907 999.  The term of the contract is from September 16, 
2010 to March 2, 2018.  Only the first 5 years are shown on this statement.  The contractor amount is $4,674,240 
annually subject to the terms of the Bid Opportunity document. Note:  Regarding the outcome of the Bid 
Opportunity for the recycling carts, if leased or financed, there are funds available in the proposed 2010-2012 
Current Estimates for these payments, if the carts were purchased outright, Capital Budget approval would be 
required.
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CONSULTATION 
 
In preparing this Report there was consultation with: 
 
Legal Services Division (as to Legal issues) 
Materials Management Division 

 
 

SUBMITTED BY 
 
Water and Waste Department 
Solid Waste Services Division 
Prepared by: Darryl Drohomerski, C.E.T. / Randy Park, C.E.T. 
Date: January 22, 2010 
File No.  011-15-09-04-00 
 
c: Manager of Legal Services/City Solicitor, Legal Services Division (e-mail) 
  Manager of Materials, Corporate Finance Department (e-mail) 
  L. Toews, Finance and Administration, Water and Waste Department (e-mail) 
 J. Smalley, C.E.T., Water and Waste Department (e-mail) 
 
Appendices 
 

Appendix A - 
Recycling Study Public 
 

Appendix B - Probe 
Online Panel Recycling 
 

Appendix C - 
Omnibus Recycling St 
 

Appendix D - Probe 
Web Link Recycling Re 

Appendix E - Open 
Houses Recycling Stu 
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